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W hat a difference a decade can
   make! In , in the mountains
of western North Carolina, the

Sensabaugh family was doing well, consid-
ering the circumstances. A widow was rais-
ing four sons and a daughter. The two oldest
sons were both recent college graduates and
medical doctors; the elder brother newly mar-
ried and with an infant son. The daughter
was just off to college in Asheville. And the
two youngest sons, both teenagers, were still
at home.

Ten years pass. The eldest son is dead of
lingering disease contracted in the Civil War.
He left his son from his first marriage (whose
mother had died just after his first birthday),
and a second wife and infant daughter. The
second son died in the war. The third son is
buried hundreds of miles away at a Union
P.O.W. camp. Only the eldest daughter and
youngest son remain.

Background
Reverend Joseph Rogers Sensabaugh was
born in  in Hawkins County, Tennessee,
the son of David Sensabaugh and Katherine
Groves, and the grandson of John and Eve
Sensabaugh of Augusta County, Virginia.
Joseph was a Methodist circuit preacher, and
was assigned to a Missouri circuit. His health
failed in the climate, and he returned to a
circuit in the mountains of western North
Carolina. He married Elizabeth Caroline
Wells. They had five children: Leonidas
Franklin “Leon” Sensabaugh, born  July
; Marion Napoleon “Nap or M.N.”
Sensabaugh, born  July ; Elizabeth
Katherine “Kittie or Kate” Sensabaugh, born
 January  ; John Summerfield
Sensabaugh born  December ; and Jo-
seph Haskew Sensabaugh born  Decem-
ber . When their father Joseph died in
, Elizabeth, who had just turned , was

left to raise five children aged  years to 
months.

By , however, the widow appeared to be
managing quite well. Both Leon, living in
Waynesville, and Napoleon, living in nearby
Webster, were medical doctors, trained at the
University of Pennsylvania. Leon had mar-
ried Mary Caroline Fitzgerald on  May .
Their son Oscar Fitzgerald Sensabaugh ar-
rived on July th the next year. Napoleon
was just setting up his medical practice. Kittie
was just entering Asheville Female College.
John and Joseph were still at home with their
mother in Waynesville.

The rest of this article tells the family’s story
over the next ten years in their own words, in
letters they wrote to each other. Brief segues,
in italics, have been included between let-
ters to mention intervening events and pro-
vide continuity. Original spelling and punc-
tuation have been kept; the few illegible
words are marked as “[____]”.

Off to College
We begin with advice from Napoleon  to his
younger sister Kittie, just shy of  and off to
college in Asheville.

wwwwwwwwwwwwwwww
Webster, N.C.
Dec. , 

My dear Sister:

You have at length got to school, in the me-
tropolis of Western Carolina. I suppose you
are busily engaged with your studies, so much
so that you have but very little time to read
letters; but I concluded tonight, that I would
write you, as it is likely your mind, in spite of
you, runs on home & friends. You were
placed, at once, upon your arrival in Ashville,
in a condition well calculated to confuse you;
and almost carry you off, and no doubt but
that you are often still placed in rather pecu-
liar circumstances owing to your being en-
tirely unacquainted with the customs, crooks
and turns belonging to college life. In order
that you get along pretty well, it will be nec-
essary that you do not forget yourself; always
keep your mind on what you are doing, and if
any of your school mates attempts to play of
tricks on you maintain a perfect insensibility
to their movements. Be sure to always keep
your trunk locked. You will find that there are
some girls who will appear to be extrimly
friendly with you, and all right in every way;
but it will be proper for you not to form any
very close intimacy with any girl until you get
fully acquainted, unless it be one you already
know to be true, as it is frequently the case
that a certain class of individuals attempt to
take advantage of a stranger, by working
themselves into their company by all kinds of
friendly turns &c. But when you find them
out, they have been thrown aside by the other
company and are trying to keep their credit
up by seeking your society; or if this be not

Renew Thyself!
If you don’t get your Spring  issue of
the Sensebach Heritage, don’t blame it on
Y2K. With this issue all subscriptions
(except for the true believers who already
subscribed for ) have run out. To
renew, send a check for $10 (U.S. sub-
scribers), along with the enclosed sub-
scription form, to the address on the
form. For our Canadian subscribers,
send a check for $11 in U.S. funds

(marked accordingly on
the check).2


